
BID TABULATION
City of Clearwater

East WRF Screw Press Pump Station Replacement 
Jones Edmunds Project No. 03720-062-01

Bid Date: May 8, 2024  -  2:00 pm 

Base Bid
Item # Unit QTY Description Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit price Extended Price

1 LS 1 Mobilzation/Demobilization (not to exceed 8% of Total 
Base Bid) 251,000.00$        251,000.00$        327,385.00$        327,385.00$                225,143.00$        225,143.00$               

2 LS 1 Screw Lift Station Updgrades 2,424,000.00$     2,424,000.00$     3,525,045.00$     3,525,045.00$             2,506,000.00$     2,506,000.00$            

3 AL 1 Refurbishment of Slide Gates 144,000.00$        144,000.00$        144,000.00$        144,000.00$                144,000.00$        144,000.00$               
4 LF 300 Crack Repair 210.00$               63,000.00$          264.80$               79,440.00$                  250.00$               75,000.00$                 
5 SF 15 Spall Repair 500.00$               7,500.00$            760.00$               11,400.00$                  1,200.00$            18,000.00$                 

6 LF 75 Expansion Joint Repair 80.00$                 6,000.00$            79.95$                 5,996.25$                    200.00$               15,000.00$                 
7 LS 1 Owner's Contingency 289,000.00$        289,000.00$        409,326.63$        409,326.63$                -$                     -$                            

Total Base Bid Amount 3,184,500.00$     4,502,592.88$             $2,983,143.00

A 1 LS Slide Gate Replacement  - N/A  - N/A + $97,515.00 + $97,515.00 No Bid No Bid 

B 1 LS Individual Bypass  - N/A  - N/A N/A N/A No Bid No Bid 

C 1 LS Omitting Concrete Reapir of Effluent Channel  - N/A  - N/A - $34,315.00 - $34,315.00 No Bid No Bid 

A. Proposal / Bid Bond X X X
X X X

C. Affidavit X X X
D. Non-Collusion Affidavit X X X
E. Proposal X X X
F. Addendum Sheet X X X
G. Bidder's Proposal X X X
H. Scrutinized Companies and Business Operations with Cuba and Syria Certification Form X X X
I. Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List Certification Form X X X
J. E-Verify Form X X X
K. Florida Trench Safety Form X

Calculation Error Non-Responsive

Total Alternate Bid Amount

B. Power of Attorney 

ATTACHMENTS TO BID

Palmettto, Florida Tarpon Springs, Florida 

C&T Contracting Services, LLC 
11023 Countryway Blvd.,                        

Tampa, Florida 

Razorback LLC                                          
177 Anclote Road

Deductive Bid Alternate 

TLC Diversified, Inc.                                 
2719 17th St. East
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